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AGENDA 
 
 

Wednesday, January 22, 2025 
9:00 A.M. – Senate Room A, #305 

General Assembly Building, 3rd Floor 
 

The meeting will be streamed and available for viewing on the 
Virginia Senate Live Session Video Stream Link 

 
 
 

I. Chair’s Remarks 

 

II. Senate Bills: 

 
BILL NO. PATRON: RELATED TO: 

SB785 Suetterlein Real Estate Board; transfer of license, fee. 

SB830 Locke 
Eviction Diversion Pilot Program; name change, 
expiration repealed. 

SB842 Favola 
mobile health clinics; DHCD to include broadband access 
services for clinics. 

 
 

Public Safety and Claims Subcommittee Report: 
(Bills heard in Public Safety and Claims Subcommittee on January 22, 2025) 

BILL NO. PATRON: RELATED TO: 

SB747 Favola 
Juvenile and domestic relations district courts; mental 
health and social assessments. 

SB757 Locke 
Trespass with an unmanned aircraft system; contracted 
defense facility, penalty. 

SB848 Salim Firearms, certain; age requirement for purchase, penalty. 

SB861 Reeves Escape from jail or custody; penalty. 

SB880 Ebbin 
Assault firearms; carrying in public areas prohibited, 
penalty. 

SB881 Ebbin 
Plastic firearms or receivers, unserialized firearms, etc.; 
transfer, etc., prohibited, penalties. 

SB883 Perry 
Firearms; purchase, etc., assault and battery of family 
member or intimate partner, penalties. 

SB886 Perry Trigger activator; definition, penalty. 

SB891 Salim Firearms; five day waiting period, penalty. 

SB926 Stuart 
Assault and battery; adds officers of Va. Marine Police to 
definition of law-enforcement officer. 

http://virginia-senate.granicus.com/ViewPublisher.php?view_id=3
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB785
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB830
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB941
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB747
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB757
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB848
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB861
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB880
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB881
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB883
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB886
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB891
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB926
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SB941 DeSteph 
Robbery; use of air or gas operated weapon, etc., 
penalty. 

SB1110 

Williams 
Graves 

Weapons; possession prohibited in a hospital that 
provides mental health or developmental services. 

SB1134 Boysko 
Storage of firearms in a residence where a minor or 
person prohibited from possessing a firearm is present; 
penalty. 

SB1181 Deeds 
Purchase, possession, sale, transfer, etc., of assault 
firearms and certain ammunition feeding devices 
prohibited; penalty.  

SB1182 Deeds 
Capitol Sq. or building owned/leased by the 
Commonwealth, carrying firearm/explosive material, etc. 

SB1220 DeSteph Carrying concealed weapons; exceptions; penalty. 

SB1248 Hackworth 
Fire Prevention Code; prohibition on permit fees for 
certain localities. 

SB1329 Marsden Carrying concealed weapons; exception; penalty.  

SB1409 Bagby 
Restorative housing and isolated confinement; restrictions 
on use. 

 

https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB941
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1110
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1134
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1181
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1182
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1220
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1248
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1329
https://lis.virginia.gov/bill-details/20251/SB1409

